
Peyton Manning Shouts ‘Omaha’ 44 Times! 
 
As you, my regular subscribers, know by now, Almighty God often 
uses sporting events to verify Bible Prophecy, and for Barack Obama 
he uses the number 44 because Obama is our 44th president. And 
thus we see he is symbolized by the Leopard in Daniel, chapter 7, 
verse number 6, which has four heads and four wings. And please do 
not listen to the false prophets who say that the Leopard is somehow 
Germany. This is an impossibility because the Leopard symbolizes 
both a king and a kingdom.  
 
In the near time fulfillment, the Leopard was Alexander the Great and 
Greece but in the end times the Leopard symbolizes the United States 
and Barack Obama. And now, just this past week in the NFL, in one of 
their championship games, quarterback Peyton Manning shouted out 
the word, ‘Omaha’ forty-four times, and if you don't believe me, listen to 
this audio and count the number of times: ‘Touchdown is risky..Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, Omaha, 
Omaha, Omaha, Omaha.’  
 
So why did Peyton Manning choose the word ‘Omaha’ and why did he 
say it 44 times, not 43 times, and not 45 times? The fact is he was 
prophesying and that's because O-ma-ha symbolizes O-ba-ma.  
 

 
 
The next question is, how many times will Peyton Manning shout out 
Omaha now that I have explained its relationship to Obama. 
Incidentally, did you notice the number on Peyton Manning's jersey?  
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His number is 18 and of course 18 can be expressed as 6 plus 6 plus 6 
and 666 is the number of a man, it is the number of the Antichrist and 
the Antichrist will succeed Barack Obama, just as the fourth beast 
succeeds the Leopard.  
 
in Daniel 7, 666 will defeat 444, and the week before in the NFL 
wildcard game, Indianapolis defeated Kansas City 45 to 44, and quite 
a few of my subscribers brought my attention to the fact that the score 
was tied at 44-44 at the 4:44 mark on the time clock; so let me read 
this headline and I think it's kind of interesting, ‘Chiefs- Colts AFC wild-
card playoff: Indianapolis comes back from 38 to 10 deficit, beats 
Kansas City 45 to 44.’ 
 
And our Lord was also showing the defeat of number 44, Barack 
Obama, in high school basketball games just this past week. Let's take 
a look at this amazing clip of a full court shot with the score tied at 44 
and the final score was 47 to 44.  
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This amazing full court shot broke a 44-44 tie. Now in this next clip 
from another high school basketball game, I won't show you the whole 
thing for copyright reasons, but it's interesting that the ball hangs on 
the rim, and these videos are getting millions of views, and it's not so 
much the score in this particular game but the number in the 
background on this particular shot. Now does this crazy rim shot 
prophesy that Barack Obama is about to fall or that he won't fall? 
 

 
 

In this final clip, we see one more verification that Obama's number in 
Bible Prophecy is 44 as he receives a t-shirt from the Miami Heat: they 
were the champions of the NBA this past year, and this time, this is his 
second 44 jersey from them, instead of writing Obama on the t-shirt, 
they wrote POTUS and POTUS means President of the United States.  
 

 
 
So, in conclusion, thank you Almighty God for verifying once again that 
Barack Obama is indeed number 44 in Bible Prophecy: he is the 
Leopard in Daniel, chapter 7, verse number 6, and as always if you 
would like to understand all the prophecies of Daniel you need to visit 
my thirdeaglemedia.com website where I have unsealed Daniel. 
Remember, you cannot understand the prophecies of Daniel as they 
are printed in your bible because they are sealed up, you must 
rearrange the verses and the chapters if you also want to understand 
these very critical prophecies for the End Times. 
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