
Sony Cyber Attack: Another 8:15 Event? 
 
The question I want to to ask on this program: ‘Is the Sony Cyber 
Attack Another 8:15 Event?’ And the reason I ask that is because 
that hacking of the Sony Corporation occurred at 8:15. And if you 
watch my programs on a regular basis, you know that not only does 
Almighty God use numerology to give bible prophecy, for example, the 
Antichrist's number is 666, but also the Illuminati: they imitate God. 
They are controlled by Satan and they mimic his actions; thus they 
also like to use numerology in their nefarious prophecies.  
 
Maybe you remember in that video, ‘Steal My Girl’, the Antichrist, who 
was surreptitiously played by Danny DeVito, arrived in a Cadillac with a 
license plate which included the numbers 666.  
 

 
 
That was not accidental. And, maybe you remember ‘Stacy's Deviled 
Eggs’ where Stacy carries 16 deviled eggs on a plate and 16 half eggs 
would be 8 whole eggs and that would be 2/3’s of a dozen.  
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And of course, you my subscribers also know that 2/3rds is another 
number of the Antichrist because 2 is placed before 3 or over 3 which 
yields the decimal .666; and none of this is accidental.  
 
Of course, Almighty God's use of numerology is far more important, as 
when He struck the Vatican with lightning at exactly 5:55 pm of the day 
Pope Benedict resigned.  
 

 
 
That was not accidental either. That was true Prophecy. 555 is the 
number for Mary's Rosary in Scripture. Nor was it an accident when 
Pope Francis was elected, the smoke came out of the chimney at 
7:06pm. That is an evil number because 7:06 is 6pm plus 60 minutes 
plus 6 minutes, another expression of 666.  
 

 
 
And that brings us up to the time of 8:15. Are the Illuminati planning an 
attack on the United States at that hour? Don't forget, that was the 
hour that the first atomic bomb was dropped on Hiroshima. Are the 
Illuminati going to use that time as a date for retribution, payback to the 
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United States? And we've already seen several manifestations of that 
number, for example, 8:15 in that Cartier watch commercial. 
 

 
 
That commercial was about the destruction of the Leopard and in Bible 
prophecy, the Leopard symbolizes both President Barack Obama and 
the United States. And don't forget 8:15 was also the hour that the 
District Attorney in Ferguson, Missouri announced the Grand Jury 
decision, that very inflammatory decision, which caused race riots. 
Another example of destruction to the United States.  
 

 
 
But now comes a third manifestation of the number 8:15. One of my 
subscribers, Patrick Covington, sent me a link to this very interesting 
article which appeared in Fortune Magazine a few days ago on 
December the 12th and this is by Sheila Marikar, and I want to read 
the important parts of this article to you: ‘The Monday before 
Thanksgiving, we all came to work. Some people had turned on 
their computers and were working. At around 8:15 am, that black 
screen of death came on (now, isn't that interesting phraseology?) 
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They shut down the entire network. We couldn't really work the 
rest of the week, which seemed OK because it was a holiday 
week. But as Tuesday and Wednesday progressed, it became 
clear that this wasn't a simple hack.’  
 
Thank you very much, Patrick Covington, for sending me this article. It 
certainly would appear to me that it was not a simple hack. I really 
doubt if North Korea could have pulled off this cyber attack. Was this 
planned and executed by the Illuminati? And if so, that would explain 
why it began at 8:15. Please notice that all three of these 8:15 
manifestations involved attacks on the United States: the attack on the 
Leopard from the Cartier watch commercial, the race riots in Ferguson, 
and now this cyber attack on the Sony Corporation. I am beginning to 
think this is not an accident, however, I am not 100 percent sure, it's 
possible this is just coincidence.  
 
Lately, I've been communicating with Ines Krupa, who lives in 
Germany, and I'll show her picture here so you'll know who I am talking 
about. She has done some other very interesting videos and she has 
been asking the Holy Spirit about the meaning of 8:15 and she says 
the Holy Spirit revealed to her that it is not a date, it is not an hour. The 
Holy Spirit says that it is a mathematical formula and I am beginning to 
agree. If that is the case and if I am understanding it correctly, I may 
not be able to reveal to you the hidden meaning.  
 
Here on YouTube, I tell you 95 percent of what I know but I can't tell 
you everything and the reason is because that would give too much 
information to the enemy. I am beginning to believe that this 8:15 
number falls into that category. Consequently, I am asking you, my 
subscribers, to let me know whenever you see any manifestations of 
this number, 8:15, because I do believe it is very significant.  
 
In conclusion, on Christmas day, this movie, ‘The Interview’, will be 
opening.  
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I’m not sure I would want to be in any movie theater at 8:15! Of course, 
Barack Obama says not to worry. On the other hand, he is the one 
who has publicly stated that he worries about a nuclear attack on New 
York City. In addition, we have open borders on the South so terrorists 
can come into the United States at any time. In a way though, I agree 
with Ines Krupa, I don't think 8:15 refers to a date or hour, but we could 
be wrong.  
 
Anyway, I will put the link to, first of all, the Fortune magazine article 
below. That's extremely interesting; you should read that article. I am 
also going to put a link to Ines Krupa's video where she explains what 
she means by 8:15 being a mathematical formula and incidentally, I 
am also going to put a link to Ines Krupa's music videos because she 
has recorded my song, ‘Doom and Gloom’ and if you are interested in 
purchasing it from iTunes, at least I think that's where it is, I am not at 
all familiar with how that works, but I will put the link below because 
you may be interested.  
 

 
Link to Fortune article: http://fortune.com/2014/12/20/sony-pictures-
entertainment-essay/?xid=yahoo_fortune 
 
Link to Ines Krupa's music video "Doom and Gloom" by William 
Tapley: https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=SrrQBHQcQ_g 
 
Link to Ines Krupa's mathematical formula of 8:15:  From 5:43 mins 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=BXChgZj6J_s&t=342s 
 

http://fortune.com/2014/12/20/sony-pictures-entertainment-essay/?xid=yahoo_fortune
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